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As a groundbreaking Top-Tier digital
acceleration office, Upthrust implements
result-driven growth marketing
processes and builds high-performing
digital products for ambitious companies
and large corporations. 

Upthrust is part of Customer Collective
(www.customercollective.eu) 

As opposed to other players in the
European market, our companies work
closely together. For each project, we
design the perfect team with
complementary profiles. Using a mix of
expertise and skills, we guide you towards
more customer ownership and
measurable impact.

About Upthrust

www.upthrust.eu
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01CrazyEgg

04

CrazyEgg’s developers built a hack to help
businesses reach their website goals quickly. 
It’s a heat mapping tool for websites. 

What’s a heat map? Heat maps track the interactions
users have with your site so you can see what’s
working and what isn’t. With the data, you have the
ability to greatly improve your site, test new ideas,
and increase conversions.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
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02 Hubspot
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Hubspot is the ultimate B2B customer relationship
management (CRM) tool. 

You can use it for lead and deal tracking and to
monitor the performance of your marketing and
sales teams and inbound marketing automation. The
beauty of this tool is that everything is done from a
single dashboard which is easy for sales and
marketing teams to adapt and interact with.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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03 Sumo
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Building lists is an essential element for any business. 

Sumo makes the process easy by giving you tools to
create a range of non-intrusive scrolls and pop-ups
on your site. The tools help you drive traffic to your
site, capture potential leads, and work your magic on
converting them into sales. 

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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04 MixRank
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If your business needs the full growth hack package,
MixRank is the tool. 

It combines both sales and marketing tools to help
your business find new customers and zero-in on
the top sales leads. It’s almost like a spy tool in that
it allows you to monitor the traffic of your
competition and see what’s happening on their
landing pages and ad copy. If you need to identify
the origin of your traffic, MixRank will tell you.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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05 Unbounce
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Companies looking to easily A/B test landing pages
can rest easy. 

Unbounce gives you the ability to drag and drop
elements into templates so you can constantly
create and publish landing pages. There are loads of
customization options, and it even has a pop-up and
sticky page builder. The best part is that it only
requires minimal technical skill to implement this
tool.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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06 Zapier
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Zapier is a must-have for every growth marketer.

Zapier is a tool that connects 1,000+ marketing
tools to each other to create powerful automations.
No code necessary. When an event happens in one
app, Zapier can tell another app to perform (or do) a
particular action.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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07 Canva
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Canva is an easy-to-use design platform that allows
you to create a variety of graphics for your business.

Canva has templates for everything from social
media images to marketing brochures, flyers to
business cards, presentations to web banners, and
just about everything in between. 

This tool should not be missing in your arsenal of
growth hacking tools.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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08 Import.io

1 1

‘Scraping’ is one of the growth hacking skills that
most people get most excited about. 

Import.io is a web-based platform designed to allow
users to easily extract web data for their analytics,
big data, data visualization, machine learning or
artificial intelligence projects.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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09 Calendly
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It is important to optimize your time. That is why
Calendly is a commonly used tool among growth
hackers and startup-entrepreneurs. 

Calendly gives your potential customers the
opportunity to immediately schedule an
appointment in your agenda. This way you don’t
have to email back and forth to plan an appointment
and your sales calls automatically appear in your
diary.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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10 SEMrush
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Semrush is an all-in-one tool suite for improving
online visibility and discovering marketing insights.

The tools and reports are able to help marketers that
work in the following services: SEO, PPC, SMM,
Keyword Research, Competitive Research, PR,
Content Marketing, Marketing Insights, Campaign
Management. A must-have tool for growth
marketers. Oh, and some basic features are totally
free to use.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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11 Outgrow
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Outgrow is cloud-based marketing solution which
allows users to create custom interactive quizzes
and calculators with built-in lead generation.

Leads can be generated on any stage of the quiz or
calculator, and built-in email validation aims to
ensure each lead generated is authentic.

A must-have for any growth marketer with ambition!

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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12 Vero
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B2B businesses often work with email campaigns,
and sometimes reaching out to all of your customers
and potential customers can be a hassle. 

Vero is an automated email tool that analyzes
people who visit your site and then sends targeted
and highly personalized emails. As they advertise,
their product is a way to scale personalization. Plus,
there are A/B testing features on the platform to let
you see what’s working and what isn’t.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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13 Buzzsumo
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With content marketing, no other tool compares.

 Buzzsumo is a tool that lets you search for the
highest performing content topics on multiple
platforms like Facebook, Twitter, LinkedIn, Pinterest,
and Reddit. From there, your marketing teams can
make better decisions on trending topics to write
about. It also provides total engagement and
Evergreen metrics to let you see what topics are
good for the long term. 

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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14 Drift
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Drift grew exponentially over the past few years
because they’re at the forefront of bot technology to
help businesses convert. 
Their concept is called ‘conversation marketing’
which incorporates loads of chatbot software. The
idea is that a customer arrives on your site and even
when you’re not available, the bot can take them
through a large part of the buying process. Then it
can forward that information with analytics to your
sales team. This tool is Growth Hacking 2.0.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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15 RollWorks
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Many B2B businesses work on an account-to-
account basis, and Rollworks is the tool to help with
account based marketing, or ABM. With the
Rollworks platform you can identify target accounts
and then implement marketing strategies like
digital ads, email signatures, and personalized web
visits. It all integrates into sales automation features
and then allows you to analyze the effectiveness of
your campaigns. If your B2B business has an
account-based approach, this is the tool for you!

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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16 Hunter.io
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Sometimes you know exactly who you want to
contact, but you don’t have this person's email
address. 

Insert Hunter.io, it’s an email hunter tool that helps
marketers find the contact information associated
with any domain. This is ideal for companies that
use cold emailing as a way to fill their pipeline.
Furthermore, Email Hunter can be used to verify
emails and do bulk tasks.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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17 Albacross
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Discover which people are visiting your website with
Albacross! 

Albacross is a lead generation and account
intelligence platform. It helps marketing and sales
teams identify their ideal customers visiting their
website and gives them the insights they need to
generate more qualified leads, make prospecting
more efficient and close more deals. 

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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18 Lemlist
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Lemlist is email computerization and cold effort
programming tool that allows you to send cold
messages to an intended interest group. 

With Lemlist you're able to kickstart your client
relationships by making your cold emails highly
personalized. It allows you as well to, automate
subsequent meet-ups, and draw in leads across all
channels. 

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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19 Keap
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While Hubspot is a CRM better suited for B2B, Keap
is the CRM growth hack tool for B2C companies.
Keap has a treasure trove of sales and marketing
tools to help you create pipelines and automate
marketing campaigns so you can focus on other
tasks. 
What makes it a B2C option is the large amount of
integrations with other B2C marketing software—
even Hubspot if you only use it for marketing
campaigns!

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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20AWeber
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AWeber is a powerhouse when it comes to email
marketing campaigns. This tool allows you to create
mailing lists that capture useful data. 

Also, you can design creative newsletters and
landing pages that work with email capture
applications. Last, you can automate your email
marketing campaigns with auto response tools and
effectively analyze data from your campaigns. 

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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21 HelloBar
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Hello Bar is a web or site based tool that allows you
to design messages and pop ups that engage with
your website visitors.
It combines the growth hacking mantras of lead
generation and conversion and helps to enhance
your site. If you’re looking for a tool to capture a lot of
emails and convert with a highly targeted marketing
campaign, this is one! Plus, CrazyEgg purchased the
company back in 2012, so it integrates well with their
heat mapping and A/B testing features.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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22 BounceX
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B2C businesses must understand customer
behavior, and BounceX is one of the most
comprehensive tools to fulfill that need.

Its ‘Exit-intent’ technology is so intuitive that it
actually can detect when someone is about to exit
your page, which allows you to take action before
they go. The tool also integrates some amazing A/B
testing features for calls-to-action (CTAs).

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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23 Amplitude
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Looking for the premiere data analytics tool? You
found it. Amplitude can help your team to dissect
data and provide you with the key information
needed to set up a good product strategy, improve
your engagements, and optimize your marketing
and sales pipelines to increase conversions. 

Why is this a hack? Because data is only good if you
can properly analyze it and take action.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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24Hotjar
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Where CrazyEgg is one of our best growth hacking
tools and better suited for B2B, Hotjar is the best
alternative heat mapping tool suited for B2C
business. While CrazyEgg is great for tracking
individual site visitors, HotJar can help you gather
and analyze data that tilts toward large scale user
behavior as opposed to individual. It doesn’t get all
the A/B testing elements involved. Instead, you can
use surveys and feedback polls which work much
better for B2C.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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25FOMO

30

Everyone knows the Booking.com-warnings, like
“Only 2 rooms left in this hotel”, “76 others are looking
at this hotel right now”.... Very annoying, but it does
works to be honest. 

It's called the scarcity-principle or “Fear Of Missing
Out” and that is exactly what this eponymous
company does for you: notifications and fomo-
statements directly integrated on your website or
ecommerce platform.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
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26Hootsuite
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Hootsuite is the ultimate social media management
tool.

 With it, you can schedule posts on multiple
platforms and monitor your engagements in real
time. It also provides a lot of quality analytics tools
that integrate with other platforms so you can
streamline your social media marketing campaigns.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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27 Highlight and
Share
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Highlight and Share is a WordPress plugin that
helps you grow traffic by making things on your site
or within your content marketing easy to share on
social media. 

The plugin allows visitors to highlight things on the
page and then share them immediately on any social
platform.

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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Twitter isn’t high on the priority list for a lot of
businesses, but this plugin is free and easy to apply
to any content marketing campaign. 

Buzz on social media for your business can’t hurt
right? Click to Tweet allows you to embed a link to a
pre-constructed tweet that users can post to their
account. The platform has analytics to help you track
the tweets.

Click to tweet

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/


03

29

35

If you’re looking for full automation with lead
generation through social media, look no further
than Phantombuster. 

It helps you to scrape data from most social media
platforms. From there you can link it to your social
media accounts and automatically interact with the
prospects when they post things. It has customized
messaging functions, and the best part is that you
don’t have to know how to code to use it.

Phantombuster

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
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This is a tool specifically for the growth hackers
that write a lot of copy.

The Hemingway app is a writing and editing tool
designed to help polish up your writing. It focuses on
identifying common errors that bring down the
quality of your text: confusing sentence construction,
overuse of weak adverbs, excessive passive voice, and
the like. A very similar tool that you could use is
Grammarly.

Hemingway

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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CopyAI is an advanced AI copywriter that helps you
create highly engaging ad copy’s. You’ll have access
to deep learning capabilities that will help you with
relevant messaging, creative concepts, and more.

You simply describe your product and copy.ai will
handle the rest. No more tedious and painstaking
research or laborious copywriting – just great ads!

Copy.ai

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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Makezu is an AI-prospecting engine technology,
that makes your customer experience and social
media management easy by automating your
actions on Twitter. 
They offer highly customizable automation based on
selected keywords and topics related to your
business. It also auto-replies mentions and sends
welcome messages to new followers. A must-have if
you’re looking to optimize your time spend on
managing your social media presence.

Makezu.io

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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Expandi is an automated outreach tool that helps
businesses find leads on LinkedIn. 

You can choose your target audience according to
preferences and manage an outreach campaign of
personalized messages to potential clients. You can
even import a .csv file full of leads and create an ad
campaign that targets the list.

Expandi

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
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Dux Soup is a Linkedin Automation tool that will
accelerate your lead generation by targeting your
prospects with a personalized LinkedIn outreach

Dux-Soup will give you leads in a lot less time. It
keeps track of every single profile you visit and allows
you to make notes directly on the profile pages
which are saved. Dux-Soup also includes the ability
to auto-visit profiles of LinkedIn users based on
Google or LinkedIn searches.

Dux Soup

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
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MeetAlfred is a social selling platform that allows
for LinkedIn, Email & Twitter automation.

The tool is simple to use, saves a lot of time, is
reliable & safe. 

Make the most out of the MeetAlfred software and
connect with your prospects quickly and get
tangible results for your business.

MeetAlfred

www.upthrust.eu

https://www.crazyegg.com/
https://www.crazyegg.com/
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FollowLiker gives you the ability to automatically
follow, unfollow, post messages or like targeted
posts on Twitter, Instagram or Pinterest. 

Especially suitable if you want to grow one of those
channels. Sadly, there is no such alternative for
Facebook

FollowLiker

www.upthrust.eu
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Technically, Sendinblue is an email marketing tool,
but that’s not the real beauty of it. 

Sendinblue has a Facebook ads feature that
integrates with your contacts list and allows you to
retarget those contacts or to target a brand new
audience based on the old list. If your customers are
on Facebook, this is a great way to connect.

Sendinblue

www.upthrust.eu
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As you can see from some of the hacks on this list,
bots are becoming a big part of growth hacking. 

With Manychat, you can set up chat bots to respond
to incoming Facebook messages. They work for
marketing campaigns, sales, or support and can be a
key element to your Facebook business.

Manychat

www.upthrust.eu
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AdEspresso makes it super easy and fast to create
split tests on Facebook ads, AdEspresso will
provide you with a crystal clear report about which
ads are working best with which audience. 

It will even give you insights into the ad elements
that drive performance. The tool offers an easy to use
automation feature helping you to edit rules
according to the “if this, then that” model. 

AdEspresso

www.upthrust.eu
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As with most social media growth hacking tools, it’s
all about automation. 

Who has time—or wants to pay someone—to sit and
like, subscribe, comment and follow all day?

Instaranker does all of that for you and can help
more visually oriented businesses grow their
Instagram following.

Instaranker

www.upthrust.eu
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Influencer marketing is becoming a key part of many
businesses’ digital marketing plans. 

But if you’re going to spend money and work with an
influencer, you want to know they’re legit. 

With NinjaOutreach, you can filter through all the
influencers on Instagram or YouTube and figure out
which one is best for your target audience.

NinjaOutreach

www.upthrust.eu
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Owned by Adobe, this is their step into the
marketing automation world. This growth hack
comes pre-installed with a scoring system to help
you determine where leads exist in your pipeline
and how well they fit with your target audience. 

There are a lot of other automation features for
emails and lead nurturing. If you want to measure
the return on investment (ROI) of your campaigns
well, this is the tool for you.

Marketo

www.upthrust.eu
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Klaviyo is yet another marketing automation tool on
this list, but this tool is highly specified with email
marketing campaigns and companies that deal in
ecommerce. 

It can help you to segment your audience and then
send target emails to them based on their purchase
history and behaviors.

Klaviyo

www.upthrust.eu
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Surveys are an integral part of digital marketing
campaigns and help measure their effectiveness.
With Typeform you have the ability to easily create
online surveys via drag and drop, and the survey
templates are well thought out—meaning the
customer or client won’t get bored or angry.

 The platform integrates with a ton of other
applications so you can distribute the surveys with
ease.

Typeform

www.upthrust.eu
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Mailchimp used to be only a go-to email marketing
service and service provider for startups. But the
company has evolved over the years and now has
growth hacking tools worthy of any list. 
With Mailchimp, you can now integrate it with your
site and send emails based on a visitor’s web
activity. It also helps with audience segmenting and
provides recommendations for optimal send times
based on when the receiver opened your previous
emails.

Mailchimp

www.upthrust.eu
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Mailchimp used to be only a go-to email marketing
service and service provider for startups. But the
company has evolved over the years and now has
growth hacking tools worthy of any list. 
With Mailchimp, you can now integrate it with your
site and send emails based on a visitor’s web
activity. It also helps with audience segmenting and
provides recommendations for optimal send times
based on when the receiver opened your previous
emails.

Nimble

www.upthrust.eu
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GrowthBar is an SEO tool that allows you to
perform keyword research, competitive analysis,
keyword tracking, and content generation.

The tool also comes as a handy chrome extension
that is able to provide a SEO analysis straight from
the google search results.

A must-have for growth marketers working on SEO
projects.

Growthbar

www.upthrust.eu
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 Landbot gives you the possibility to quickly and
easily create your own chatbot. 

Landbot.io is a cloud-based solution that allows you
to create conversational websites, landing pages,
surveys and lead generation chat-bots to engage
with customers, creating an improved user interface
experience and optimizing your conversion rates.

Landbot.io

www.upthrust.eu
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Qualaroo will help you to increase your conversion
rates by gathering insights about your audience such
as browsing patterns and common objections
through targeted online consumer surveys. 

Get insights in a blink of an eye, adapt, and see how
your conversion rates grow! 

Qualaroo

www.upthrust.eu
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Olark is a chat application that lets you connect
with site visitors. The live chat software and
customer data tools help you learn from every online
interaction.

It will tell you who is on your site, including their
location, what they’re looking at on your site, where
they’ve been and time on site so that you can
connect with them in a more meaningful way.

Olark

www.upthrust.eu
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